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Electronics & Communication Engineering Department of Madanapalle Institute of 
Technology & Science organized National Conference during 25-26 June 2013. 

    Report by Program Coordinator Dr D. Asha Devi 

A Two Day National Conference on Advanced Communication Systems & Applications is held from 
25.6.2013 to 26.6.2013 in the Department of Electronics & Communication Engineering, MITS, 
Madanapalle under the support of TEQIP-II. The inaugural function is held from 10 AM to 11 AM on 
25.6.2013. Prof. Pallapa Venkataram, Chairman of Center for Continuing Education, IISc 
 Bangalore, is the Chief Guest and he spoke about the importance of upgrading of the technology 
in the inaugural function. In the inauguration, a video presentation was played, which is prepared 
by J.T. Pramod and got the appreciation. Conference proceedings were released by the Chief 
Guest and other dignitaries, Prof. P. Khayum, Prof. K. Sreenivas Reddy, Dr. A. R. Reddy, and Dr. 
D. Asha Devi on the Dias. Later the Chief Guest spent one hour interaction with the participants. 
He appreciated about the papers published in Conference Proceedings. 
  

We invited papers in multiple streams from academicians, researchers and industrialists and we 
have received several papers, and selected 41 quality papers out of them after peer review and 
plagiarism check. A total of 54 participants (43- External and 11- Internal) have attended the 
Conference. Each participant is provided with a kit consisting of Bag, pad, pen and conference 
proceedings. 
We have conducted the paper presentations in three parts – Part-A (VLSI Design and applications) 
On 25.6.2013 from 12.00 AM to 1.00 PM, and continued after lunch. Part-B (Signal & Image 
Processing) and Part-C (Communications, Networks and others) are conducted on 26.6.2013.  To 
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judge these presentations, we accommodate two external judges- Prof. P. Khayum and Prof. P. 
Sudhakar Reddy, and the two internal judges-Dean Raja Reddy and Prof. S. A. K. Jilani. The  
 
valedictory is conducted on 26.6.2013 at 4.00 PM. Written and verbal feedback is taken from the 
participants. The concluding session is attended by Principal, Vice Principal, Dean (Basic Science), 
Program Coordinator and the entire staff of ECE Dept. and the participants. At the end of the 
session, on each day the Certificate of distribution was done to each participant.  
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